
OTTAWA COUNTY HIGHWAY DISTRICTS 1, 2, 3

BID 2017-2018.11:  6-mo ASPHALT
OPENED:  DECEMBER 11, 2017@ 9:05 AM

Period of Bid:  January 1, 2018 thru June 30, 2018

MOTION BY CLARKE, SECOND BY EARLS, TO ACCEPT LOWEST BIDDER, TEETERS ASPHALT

BASED ON AVAILABILITY OF MATERIALS, PROXIMITY TO JOB SITE AND PAST PERFORMANCE

Page 1 of 1 APAC(Vinita) LONGAN TEETERS T & C TULSA ASPHALT LOGAN COUNTY

NO BID

PRICED PER TON

 @ PLANT

Type A HMHL $44.00 $48.50 $44.00 NO BID NO BID

Type B HMHL $47.00 $41.50 $45.00 NO BID NO BID

Type C HMHL $47.00 $53.50 $45.00 NO BID NO BID

HMCL NO BID $98.50 NO BID HMCL: $95.00

Polymer Modified Cold Patch $8.00 60# FOB $8.00 50LB 

SUBJECT $8.50

TO CHANGE PER 60 LB BAG

BASED ON MIN DELIVERY

OIL PRICES


