OTTAWA COUNTY HIGHWAY DISTRICTS 1, 2, 3

BID 2017-2018.07: 6-mo ROAD MATERIALS

OPENED: June 19, 2016 @ 9:05 AM ‘

Period of Bid: July 1, 2017 thru December 31, 2017

Motion by Russell Earls and second by John Clarke to

accept the Midwest Minerals for District # 1

Kemp Stone for District # 2 and District # 3

BASED ON PRODUCT AVAILABILITY TO JOB SITE

Page 1 of 3 APAC OKLAHOMA BINGHAM KEMP STONE MIDWEST MINERALS | | TEETER'S ASPHALT || CENTRAL SALT
PRICED PER TON
1/2" LIMESTONE SCREENINGS
QUARRY $6.00 $5.50 $5.75
DIST 1 $10.50
DIST 2 $9.00
DIST 3 $7.80
1/2" CRUSHER RUN
QUARRY $6.00 no bid no bid
DIST 1
DIST 2
DIST 3
3/4" CRUSHER RUN
QUARRY $6.90 $6.25 no bid
DIST 1 $11.25
DIST 2 510.25
DIST 3 $8.25
1" CRUSHER RUN
QUARRY $6.90 $6.25 $6.25
DIST 1 511.25
DIST 2 $10.25
DIST 3 $8.25
1-1/2" CRUSHER RUN
QUARRY $6.90 $6.00 $6.25
DIST1 $11.00
DIST 2 $510.00
DIST 3 $8.00
2-1/2" CRUSHER RUN $6.25
QUARRY $6.00
DIST1 $11.00




DIST 2 >10.00
DIST 3 $8.00
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PRICED PER TON
4" TO 6" CRUSHER RUN
QUARRY $8.00 $6.75
DIST 1 $13.00
DIST 2 $12.00
DIST 3 $10.00
1/2" CLEAN LIMESTONE ROCK
QUARRY $9.50 $9.85 $10.30
DIST1 $14.85
DIST 2 $13.85
DIST 3 $11.85
3/4" CLEAN LIMESTONE ROCK
QUARRY $9.50 $8.75 $9.50
DIST 1 $13.75
DIST 2 $12.75
DIST 3 $10.75
4" to 6" CLEAN LIMESTONE ROCK
QUARRY $8.00 $8.95
DIST1 $13.00
DIST 2 $12.00
DIST 3 $10.00
2" FILTER ROCK
QUARRY $8.00 $7.75 $7.95
DIST1 $12.75
DIST 2 $11.75
DIST 3 $9.75
3-1/2" FILTER ROCK
QUARRY $7.75 $7.95
DIST 1 $12.75
DIST 2 $11.75
DIST 3 $9.75
6" RIP RAP
QUARRY $14.00 $11.00 $12.25
DIST1 $16.00
DIST 2 $15.00
DIST 3 $13.00
DIRTY BASE LIMESTONE
QUARRY $6.00 $5.95 $6.25
DIST 1 $10.95




DIST 2 99.95
DIST 3 $7.95
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PRICED PER TON
SHOT ROCK
QUARRY $8.00 $7.85 $7.50
DIST 1 $12.85
DIST 2 $11.85
DIST 3 $9.85
ROAD SALT
QUARRY $83.00 no bid no bid no bid
DIST 1 $83.89
DIST 2 $84.00
DIST 3 $84.00
SAND
QUARRY $19.50 no bid $20.00
DIST 1 $24.50 $25.00
DIST 2 $23.50
DIST 3 $22.50




