OTTAWA COUNTY FIRE DEPARTMENTS

BID 2015-2016.30: BUNKER GEAR

OPENED: February 16, 2016 @ 9:05 AM

MOTION BY WYRICK, SECOND BY EARLS, TO ACCEPT, CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY'S BID EVEN

THOUGH IT WAS NOT THE LOW

BID,

DUE TO CASCO, THE LOW BIDDER, CHANGING THE SPECS IN THE BID
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OTTAWA COUNTY FIREFIGHTER

CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

NORTHERN SAFETY CO

CASCO INDUSTRIES

FIREMASTER APPARATUS INC

BUNKER GEAR

QUANTITY: 1-10 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,596.00 No Bid
QUANTITY: 11-20 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,596.00 No Bid
QUANTITY: 21-30 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,596.00 No Bid
QUANTITY: 31-40 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,579.00 No Bid
QUANTITY: 41-50 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,579.00 No Bid
QUANTITY: 51-60 $1,615.00 $2,185.75 $1,579.00 No Bid




