
OTTAWA COUNTY HIGHWAY DISTRICTS 1, 2, 3
BID 2014-2015.24:  6-mo PIPE MATERIAL
OPENED:  December 22, 2014 @ 9:05 AM

Period of Bid:  January 1, 2015 thru June 30, 2015

MOTION BY EARLS, SECOND BY CLARKE, TO ACCEPT

          ALL BIDS SUBMITTED, BASED ON PRODUCT AVAILABILITY

DUB ROSS RR YARD WHEELER

Priced Including Delivery to Ottawa County

USED STEEL PIPE
12" No Bid $14.50
14" $15.75
16" $23.50
18" $25.90
20" $25.90
22" $25.95
24" $27.25
26" $27.95
28" No Bid
30" $46.00
36" $49.00
48" $108.00
60" $167.00
72" $199.00

ROUND (only) CORRUGATED PIPE - 16 ga min 
12" $6.59 No Bid
15" $8.20
18" $9.80
21" $12.30
24" $13.05
30" $16.35
36" $19.80
42" $27.55
48" $31.48
54" $35.40
60" $38.90

SQUASHED CORRUGATED PIPE - 16 ga min
17" x 13" $9.20 No Bid
21" x 15" $10.80
24" x 18" $13.40
28" x 20" $14.05
35" x 24" $3.17
42" x 29" $20.83
49" x 33" $28.57
51" x 38" $32.48
64" x 43" $36.42
71" x 47" $39.90

12 ga STEEL BRIDGE DECKING - per Sheet
4' x 8' No Bid No Bid

USED RAILROAD TANK CARS - per Foot
7' No Bid $275.00
8' $275.00
9' $275.00

10' $275.00


