
OTTAWA COUNTY HIGHWAY DISTRICTS 1, 2, 3
BID 2012-2013.01:  6-mo ASPHALT
OPENED:  June 25, 2012 @ 9:05 AM

Period of Bid:  July 1, 2012 thru December 31, 2012

MOTION BY EARLS, SECOND BY WYRICK, TO ACCEPT ALL BIDS SUBMITTED, BASED ON AVAILABILITY OF MATERIALS AND PROXIMITY TO JOB SITE

Page 1 of 1 APAC BLEVINS GLOVER LONGAN TEETERS TRI-STATE TULSA

PRICED PER TON @ PLANT

Type A HMHL $54.00 No Bid $52.00 $51.50 $46.75* $49.10 No. Bid

Type B HMHL $57.00 No Bid $54.00 $57.50 $50.00* $51.40 No. Bid

Type C HMHL $60.00 No Bid $57.00 $62.50 $49.75* $51.40 No. Bid

HMCL No Bid $53.25 No Bid $98.50 No Bid $80.00 $85.00

ProLine Patch $104.25 @ Co

Asphalt Waste No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No. Bid

* WILL BE ADJUSTED AS OIL PRICES FLUCTUATE


